
  
 
 
 
DAILY BULLETIN – Thursday 21st September 2023 
                          
TO ALL STAFF: THIS IS NOT A CAT WEEK 
 
TO ALL STAFF & PUPILS: 
 
REGISTER TEACHERS - PLEASE INFORM YOUR GROUP 

 
 

S1-6  Historic Whole School Photograph-2023 - Friday 22nd Sep Period 1: This historic 
photograph will include all staff and pupils and will be taken in the school playground by 
professional photographer. Stay in Register classroom after registration on Friday morning. 

A Tannoy message will tell year groups when to come to main door. All classes will exit 
school by main door and will be accompanied to playground by your Depute Head Teacher 
and register teacher. 

S1 – 8.45                              S4 – 9.00 

S2 – 8.50                              S5 – 9.05 

S3 – 8.55                              S6 – 9.10 

Register Teacher will accompany classes and stay beside them for photograph. 

Perfect dress code must be worn. Leave jackets and bags in register class. You will collect 
them after the photograph. 

Mr Dempster 
 
S1-6 Bake Sale: The charities committee will be hosting a bake sale in the lower atrium Friday (22 

September) break in order to raise money in response to the emergency appeals for 
donations to help the thousands of people affected by the floods in Libya. You will be able to 
buy cakes or even just give donations knowing your money will be used towards medical 
supplies, hygiene kits, food, water, clothing and for rescue and evacuation missions in the 
area.  

 
Charities Committee 

 
S1-6 The Boroughmuir Chronicle: If you would like to contribute to the Boroughmuir Chronicle 

newspaper, please come along to a meeting on Monday or Thursday lunchtimes in room 
2.11. 

Ms O’Thy 
 

S1-6  Self-Care September: Don’t compare how you feel inside to how others appear outside. 
Ms O’Thy 

 
S1-6 Girls Basketball Club:  Girls Basketball Club takes place on Thursdays, straight after school 

for an hour.  The club is now open to all year groups.  Please get changed as quickly as 
possible and take your bags/clothes to the Sports Hall. 

Mr Segall 
 
S1 Boys Basketball Club:  S1 Boys Basketball Club will start on Monday.  The club takes place 

straight after school for an hour; training will be on alternate weeks with S2/3 
sessions.  Please get changed as quickly as possible in Changing Room 4 and take your 
bags/clothes to the Sports Hall 

 
Mr Segall 

   Duty Head – C Paterson 



 
S1  Programming Club: Reminder that programming club is on today (Thursday) at lunchtime in 

room x2.19 in the extension.  Bring your lunch and have some coding fun with the S6s. 
 

Mrs Dighton 
 
S1-2  Badminton Club: Lunchtime badminton club open to S1 and S2 will be starting next Monday 

lunchtime (25th September). Come to the sports hall after you've eaten, no food to be taken 
into hall. Max 20 people, so first come first served. No need to bring a change of kit, just turn 
up and play. 

Mr Smith 
 

S1-2 Self Care Club: Self-care club will start Thursday 21st of September in room X3.27 (there 
has been a change in room), if you enjoy relaxing and making new friends then this is the club 
for you.  

S5 and S6 Leaders 
 
S3-5:   Medics Club: This we will be focusing on volunteering work and other fun activities. Thursday 

after school, room 3:13 (biscuits for all!) 
 Dr MacMillan and Miss Nisbet 

 
S4-6 Geography Revision club for National 5, Higher and Advanced Higher. One of the most 

effective ways you can polish up your understanding of the courses to ensure exam success- 
highly recommended!  Room 2-04.  

Mr Das  
 

S5-6  Boys Rugby Club 🏉: Do you play Rugby for a club? Have you played in the past and  
want to get back into Rugby? Do you want to try the sport out for the very first time? 
If you would like to join the new school club or hear more about our exciting ideas for this 
Season, please come along to our first S5-S6 Boys Rugby meeting this Thursday Breaktime 
(21st) in the gym hall. 

Mr Anderson 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 


